
Heartiest wishes from the ISDM family for a promising new year! We hope that the advent of 2023 has brought warmth and joy to everyone! The last

quarter of 2022 was marked with a lot of energy, zest and progress towards our goal of creating Management Talent and Knowledge dedicated to improving

the lives of millions of people living in poverty.

The Class of 2022-23 of ISDM’s Post-Graduate Program in Development Management (PGP-DM) travelled to nine districts across India as part of the

‘Realising India’ module of their curriculum, applying the tools and methods they have been taught in the first few months of the program to understand

development realities on the field. Admissions to the Class of 2023-24 for PGP-DM was launched in December 2022 and received an enthusiastic

response from applicants.

I am extremely proud to list star additions to our Knowledge work that would go a long way in making ISDM a thought leader in the field of Development

Management. In the second year of our partnership with Citi, we've got their support for two new Centres of Excellence - Social Finance and Impact &

Data Sciences and Social Impact. We're equally thrilled to announce that ISDM is setting up a first of its kind Knowledge Institute (KI) for the Social

Sector. The KI will disseminate knowledge assets on Development Management and SDGs in a freely available and easily accessible manner to aid

research and better decision making in the sector. We've been very fortunate to have the most amazing donor fraternity who have supported us in our goal

of pushing the frontiers of management for social change. We've also received support from Capgemini India and Info Edge (India) Limited to take ahead

our work on creating Knowledge and Management talent for the Social Sector.

The second cohort of our Women on Boards program, consisting of 29 women from diverse backgrounds (corporate, medicine, academia), graduated

after concluding their last module held at Ahmedabad in December.

As a validation of the journey we’ve undertaken to integrate and optimise relevant technology to make ISDM a future ready organisation, we were awarded

a "Certification of Appreciation" for Digital Transformation Initiatives at the Edutech 100 Summit organised by ASSOCHAM National Council on

Education.

The ISDM family grew a little more in these last months, and we have added some exceptional and passionate talent, both young and with experience, to

our team. There’s always a lot brewing at ISDM. Thank you for your continued support and interest in our work and efforts.

Warmly,

Ravi Sreedharan

Founder & President, ISDM

Dear Reader,



ISDM | Must Reads

Here’s a smorgasbord of interesting reports, articles and blogs authored and
developed by ISDM’s Global Knowledge Hub that is dedicated to strengthening
and building the Body of Knowledge on Development Management

ISDM | Women On Board 2.0

The Women on Boards for Social Impact program, developed and curated by
ISDM along with Dasra and Governance Counts, is divided into three modules -
Understanding of the Social Sector and Self in that Context, Board Roles and
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Effectiveness, and Governance Mechanisms and Best Practices. It is designed
for senior women leaders who have the desire to learn and drive social impact
by being a part of Advisory Boards of non-profits. 
As part of our vision of 100 Women on Boards by 2023, we recently concluded
the second cohort of 29 women at an immersive retreat in Ahmedabad. In this
module, the cohort members got a hang of board charters and are now ready to
take up advisory roles in the Boards of different social impact organisations. 

Here are a few glimpses of the cohort in the midst of the Module 3- Governance
Mechanisms and Best Practices at Ahmedabad:

Admissions for the next cohort start in mid-January, 2023.

ISDM | Leader’s Speak

Leading minds, mentors, academia and sector experts visited us and spoke at
ISDM, sharing their valuable insights and  journeys while envisioning an
impactful social sector.

ISDM | Realising India

In the most exciting phase of the Post-Graduate Program in Development
Management, the ‘Realising India’ field immersion, students of the Class of
2022-23 got a first-hand experience of on-ground realities helping them develop
a deeper understanding of the social, cultural, and political ecosystem they will
eventually work in and strive to change #socialimpact.

Students, as part of their Professional Learning Communities (PLCs), traveled
to nine different districts of Madhya Pradesh, Rajasthan and Uttar Pradesh to
experience life in these districts and understand development from a grounds-
up perspective.



ISDM | The Donor Wall

We'd like to welcome Capgemini India, Info Edge (India) Limited and Mahesh
Srinivasan Iyer to our donor family and are grateful to Citi for their continued
partnership and for supporting new areas of our work. We're incredibly thankful
to all our donors for their support and belief in us.

ISDM | Research Insights

Bringing you the key takeaways from the first-ever study on Talent
Management in the Indian Social Sector- a report by the Centre for Social
Impact and Philanthropy (CSIP), along with the Indian School of Development
Management (ISDM)

ISDM | Recap

A glance on the recent developments and events at ISDM.



ISDM | Development Management Dialogues

If you missed them, we bring the conversations back to you:

ISDM | What are we reading?

Books that supplement the idea of the social sector and why it requires
management professionals trained with tools specific to them.
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The Development Management (DM) Newsletter aims to familiarise the reader with the concept of
Development Management and the journey ISDM has taken thus far to develop an ecosystem of experts

and context-specific knowledge for the sector.

Our Initiatives: PGP-DM, CPSJ, WOB, Research Centre , Talent Management Report
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